
AGENDA  
COMMITTEE ON GENERATIONAL, CULTURAL & ETHNIC DIVERSITY  

TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 13, 2007 
10:00 AM 

 
MINUTES: 
 
10/23/07 
 
RECEIVED & FILED 
 
7)  LEGISLATORS MICHAEL KAPLOWITZ AND WILLIAM RYAN:  Sewer 
District Modification:  Forwarding a petition from the Town of New Castle 
requesting the inclusion of parcels in the Saw Mill River Sanitary Sewer District. 
(3/27/06, B&A/E+E/LEG/PWTLP) 
 
8)  HON LOIS BRONZ: New Castle Sewer Modification:  Forwarding 
Correspondence from Patricia McDow, Yonkers City Council Majority Leader, 
with regard to the New Castle Sewer Modification Proposal. (4/24/06, B&A, E+E, 
LEG, PWTLP) 
 
ITEMS FOR DISCUSSION: 
 
Probation Commissioner Rocco Pozzi will speak about current programs in place 
for young offenders and what help is available to them when they are released 
from jail back into the community.   
 
ITEMS REFERRED TO COMMITTEE: 
 
 
17) HON. WILLIAM RYAN: Funding for Geriatric Care: Forwarding 
correspondence from Westchester Jewish Community Services with regard to 
funding for a Geriatric Case Specialist. (4/23/07, B&A, GCED) 
 
19) COMMITTEE ON GENERATIONAL, CULTURAL & ETHNIC DIVERSITY 
AND THE COMMITTEE ON HOUSING, PLANNING & GOVERNMENT 
OPERATIONS:  United States National Insurance Act:  Resolution urging the 
State to send a Home Rule Message to the Congress of the United States in 
support of the United States National Health Insurance Act (Federal Bill H.R. 
676; May 8th – composed and signed out of GCED; 5/21/07 recommitted) 
 
20) COUNTY EXECUTIVE: IMA-Step Up! Program: Proposed Act authorizing 
the County to enter into an IMA with the City of Mount Vernon, Youth Bureau to 
operate the Step Up! Program for the period September 1, 2007 through 
December 31, 2007 in an amount not to exceed $20,000. (10/22/07, B&A, 
GCED) 


